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A1 

Biotechnology 

Calibration services 

Cloud service 

Creative product design 
and development center 

Date center industrial 
estates or industrial zones 

Economic forest 
plantation 

Embedded software 

Embedded system design 

Energy Service Companies 
(ESCO) 

Engineering design 

Manufacture of aircraft, 
airframe, airframe parts, 
and major aircraft 
appliance 

Microelectronics design 

Production of electricity 
and/or steam from 
garbage or refuse derived 
fuel 

Production of electricity 
or electricity and steam 

Research and 
development 

Science and technology 
parks 

Scientific laboratories 

Software parks 

Vocational training 
centers 

A2 

Building or repair of ships 

Commercial airports 

Grading, packaging and 
storage of plants, 
vegetables, fruits or 
flowers 

Manufacture of active 
ingredients from natural 
raw materials 

Manufacture of active 
pharmaceutical 
ingredients 

Manufacture of advanced 
or nano materials or 
products produced from 
advanced or nano 
materials 

Manufacture of advanced 
technology hard disk 
drives and/or parts 

Manufacture of 
automation machinery 
and/or automation 
equipment with 
engineering design 

Manufacture of 
automobile parts for 
safety parts and energy-
saving parts 

Manufacture of chemical 
fundamental fertilizers 

Manufacture of down-
stream steel with 
continuous production 
process 

Manufacture of ductile 
cast steel parts 

Manufacture of eco-
friendly chemicals or 
polymers 

Manufacture of electronic 
control and measurement 
instruments for 
industrial/agricultural use 

Manufacture of emission, 
transmission and 
reception devices used in 
fiber-optic and wireless 
communication systems 

Manufacture of fuel cells 

Manufacture of fuel from 
agricultural products 

Manufacture of fuel from 
agricultural scrap or 
garbage or waste 

Manufacture of high 
tensile strength steel 

Manufacture of hygienic 
pulp or hygienic paper 

Manufacture of 
intermediate steel 

Manufacture of medical 
devices (high-tech) 

Manufacture of medical 
food or food supplements 

Manufacture of organics 
and printed electronics 

Manufacture of parts for 
electronic control and 
measurement instruments 
for industrial/agricultural 
use, medical/scientific 
devices and automotive 
industry 

Manufacture of parts for 
emission, transmission 
and reception devices 
used in fiber-optic and 
wireless communication 
products 

Manufacture of parts for 
hybrid, electric vehicle 
and plug-in hybrid electric 
vehicles 

Manufacture of parts for 
organics and printed 
electronics 

Manufacture of parts for 
security control 
equipment 

Manufacture of parts for 
telecommunication 
products 
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Manufacture of rubber 
products 

Manufacture of rubber 
tires for vehicles 

Manufacture of scientific 
equipment using high 
technology 

Manufacture of security 
control equipment 

Manufacture of solar cells 
and/or raw materials for 
solar cells 

Manufacture of solid state 
drives and/or parts for 
solid state drives 

Manufacture of specialty 
polymers or specialty 
chemicals 

Manufacture of technical 
fiber or functional fiber 

Manufacture of trains or 
electric trains or 
equipment or parts 

Manufacture of up-stream 
steel 

Manufacture of vehicle 
parts using high 
technology 

Manufacture of wafers 

Maritime transportation 
services 

Mass transit systems (rail 
transport) 

Product sterilization 
services 

Production of electricity 
from renewable energy 

Repair of aircraft, parts 
and equipment 

A3 

Air transportation services 

Amusement parks 

Aquariums 

Bleaching, dyeing and 
finishing or printing and 
finishing or printing 

Cable cars 

Container yards or inland 
container deports 

Convention halls 

Cultural centers or arts 
and crafts centers 

Deep sea fishery 

Enterprise software 
and/or digital content 

Fabrication industry of 
platform repair with 
engineering design 

Gem and jewelry 
industrial zones 

Industrial zone for 
environmental protection 

Industrial zone for motion 
picture production 

International distribution 
centers 

International exhibition 
centers 

Loading/unloading 
facilities for cargo ship 

Logistics park 

Manufacture of advanced 
technology electrical 
products 

Manufacture of antistatic 
plastic packaging 

Manufacture of aseptic 
plastic packaging 

Manufacture of 
automobile engines 

Manufacture of biological 
fertilizers, organic 
fertilizers, nano-coated 
organo chemical fertilizer 
and bio-pesticides 

Manufacture of biomass 
briquettes and pellets 

Manufacture of cold 
rolled electrical steel 
sheet 

Manufacture of 
equipment and/or parts 
for photonic devices 
and/or for photonic 
integrated systems 

Manufacture of flat panel 
displays 

Manufacture of flexible 
printed circuits and/or 
multi-layered printed 
circuit board and/or parts 

Manufacture of forged 
iron/steel parts 

Manufacture of functional 
yarn or functional fabric 

Manufacture of 
machinery, equipment 
and parts and/or repaid of 
mold and die 

Manufacture of material 
based on thin-film 
technology 

Manufacture of metal 
powder 

Manufacture of metal 
products or metal parts 

Manufacture of modified 

starch or starch made 
from plants that have 
special properties 

Manufacture of 
motorcycles (higher than 
248 cc) 

Manufacture of multilayer 
plastic packaging 

Manufacture of oil or fat 
from plants or animals 
(except for soybean oil) 

Manufacture of other 
aircraft parts and onboard 
devices and equipment 

Manufacture of other cast 
steel parts 

Manufacture of other 
medical devices 

Manufacture of other 
scientific equipment 

Manufacture of other 
telecommunication 
products 

Manufacture of parts 
and/or equipment for 
solar-powered products 

Manufacture of parts for 
other telecommunication 
products 

Manufacture of 
petrochemicals 

Manufacture of power 
investors for industrial use 

Manufacture of 
preservation of food 
beverages, food additives 
or food ingredients 

Manufacture of products 
from eco-friendly 
polymers 
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Manufacture of products 
from metal or alloy 
powder 

Manufacture of products 
produced from advanced 
or nano materials 

Manufacture of 
semiconductors and/or 
parts for semiconductors 

Manufacture of special 
quality glass products 

Manufacture of specialty 
pulp or specialty paper 

Manufacture of steel 
pipes 

Manufacture of tin mill 
black plate 

Motion picture supporting 
services 

Open zoos 

Plan or animal breeding 

Production of digital 
printed matter 

Production of tap water, 
industrial water or steam 

Race tracks 

Recycling and reuse of 
unwanted materials 

Tanneries or leather 
finishing 

Thai motion picture 
production 

Trading centers for 
agricultural goods 

A4 

Animal propagation or 
animal husbandry 

Assembling of machinery 

and machinery equipment 

Assembly of engines 

Fabrication industry or 
platform repair for 
petroleum industry 

Heat treatment of metal 
products 

Hotels 

Manufacture of air 
conditioners, 
refrigerators, freezers, 
washing and drying 
machines 

Manufacture of audio 
visual products 

Manufacture of bags or 
shoes or products made of 
leather or artificial leather 

Manufacture of 
compressors and/or 
motors for electrical 
appliances 

Manufacture of electro-
magnetic products 

Manufacture of ferro-alloy 

Manufacture of flat rolled 
steel products 

Manufacture of furniture 
or parts 

Manufacture of garments, 
clothing accessories and 
household textiles 

Manufacture of gems and 
jewelry or parts including 
raw materials and 
prototype 

Manufacture of high 
performance paper 
products 

Manufacture of industrial 

chemicals 

Manufacture of LED lamps 

Manufacture of lenses 

Manufacture of long steel 
products for industrial use 

Manufacture of medical 
devices made of fabrics or 
fibers (gowns, drapes etc.) 

Manufacture of memory 
storage equipment 

Manufacture of multi-
purpose engines and 
equipment 

Manufacture of natural 
extracts or products from 
natural extracts (except 
for medicine, soap, 
shampoo, toothpaste and 
cosmetics) 

Manufacture of non-
woven fabric or hygienic 
products made of non-
woven fabric 

Manufacture of office 
electronics 

Manufacture of other 
power inverters 

Manufacture of other 
yarn or fabric 

Manufacture of paper 
container coated with bio-
plastics 

Manufacture of parts for 
audio visual products 

Manufacture of parts for 
office electronics 

Manufacture of passive 
components 

Manufacture of plastic 
products from recycled 

plastic 

Manufacture of primary 
processed rubber 

Manufacture of printed 
circuit board assembly 

Manufacture of products 
from agricultural by-
products or agricultural 
waste 

Manufacture of products 
from hygienic paper 

Manufacture of recycled 
fiber 

Manufacture of top 
covers, base plates or 
peripherals for hard disk 
drives 

Manufacture of toys 

Production of electricity 
from other energy sources 
(including cogeneration) 

Rolling, drawing, casting 
or forging of non-ferrous 
metals 

Slaughtering 

B1 

Cold storage or cold 
storage and cold storage 
transportation 

Crop drying and silo 
facilities 

Distribution centers 

Ferry services or tour boat 
services or tour boat 
renting 

Health rehabilitation 
centers 

Industrial zones or 
industrial estates 
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International 
Headquarters 

International Trading 
Centers 

Manufacture of ceramic 
products 

Manufacture of flat rolled 
steel products for 
construction use 

Manufacture of general 
automobile 

Manufacture of glass 
products 

Manufacture of long steel 
products for construction 
use 

Manufacture of medicine 

Manufacture of musical 
instruments 

Manufacture of other 
electrical products 

Manufacture of other 
electronic products 

Manufacture of other 
fibers 

Manufacture of other 
steel pipes 

Manufacture of other 
vehicle parts 

Manufacture of parts 
and/or equipment for 
other electrical products 

Manufacture of plastic 
products for industrial 
goods 

Manufacture of printed 
matter 

Manufacture of sports 
equipment or parts 

Manufacture of sunglass 
lenses, cosmetic lenses, 
eyeglass frames and parts 

Manufacture of wire 
harnesses 

Natural gas stations 

Oil refinery 

Pipeline transportation  

Potash mining and/or 
dressing 

Prospecting of minerals 

Surface treatment or 
anodized surface 
treatment 

Tour boat port services 

B2 

Coil center 

E-commerce 

Hotels in provinces 

Manufacture of fire-
resistant materials or heat 
insulation 

Manufacture of gypsum 
board or gypsum products 

Trade and investment 
support offices 

 


